CCS ENTRY FORM
LAKE CIRCUIT COURT, PROBATE DIVISION
CROWN POINT, INDIANA

ESTATE NO. 45C01-0807-EU-188

TITLE OF CAUSE: ADMINISTRATION OF ESTATE OF ROBERT P. BOLIN, DECEASED

The activity of the Couwrt should be summarized as follows on the Chronological Case Summary (CCS):

Personal Representative, Marjorie M. Zemkewicz, by counsel, files Personal Representative’s Response to
Preliminary Objection to Revised Preliminary Account, Petition for Allowance of Fees to Personal
Representative and Attorney and form Order Allowing Fees of Personal Representative and Atforney.
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J. Brian Hittinger (#16428-64) Shaun T. Olsen
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[ ] Placed in the case file;
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STATE OF INDIANA ) LAKE CIRCUIT COURT

) SS: PROBATE DIVISION
COUNTY OF LAKE ) CROWN POINT, INDIANA
ADMINISTRATION OF ESTATE OF )

ROBERT P. BOLIN, - ) ESTATENO. 45C01-0807-EU-188
DECEASED. )

PETITION FOR ALLOWANCE OF FEES TO
PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE AND ATTORNEY

Comes now, Marjorie M. Zemkewicz, as Personal Representative of the estate of
Robert P. Bolin, deceased, who being duly sworn upon her oath, respectfully petitions and shows
the Court as follows:

1. That said Marjorie M. Zemkewicz, qualified as Personal Representative of the
decedent’s estate on the 18" day of July, 2008, and said estate has been fully administered,
except for certain objections to final account, final distribution and closing of said estate.

2, That upon the Personal Representative qualifying, she employed J. Brian
Hittinger of Krieg DeVault LLP as her attorney and said attorney has continuously acted since
such employment and 1s now acting as attorney for said Personal Representative.

3. The services of Personal Representative and her attorney have included, among
other things, the following usual and customary services rendered in the administration of said
decedent’s estate:

a. Preparation instructions to Personal Representative of Unsupervised Estate.
b. Obtain Consent for Unsupervised Administration of Estate by all heirs.

¢. File Appearance.

d. Publish Notice of Unsupervised Administration.

e. Prepare Petition to Open Unsupervised Estate. :
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f. Calculate inheritance tax.
g. Preparation of Petition to Waive Filing of Indiana Inheritance Tax Return and
for a Determination of No Tax Due.
4, In addition to the foregoing services, said Personal Representative and her

attorney were required to and did render the following special services:

a.

o

Preparation of several drafts of proposed Real Estate Purchase Agreements in
order to try and facilitate the sale of the estate’s real estate to heir, David
Bolin.

Several attempts to negotiate sale of the estate’s real estate with David Bolin's
first attorney, James Nagy.

Manage switch of David Bolin’s attorney from James Nagy to Shaun Olsen.
Manage switch of estate from unsupervised to supervised at request of David
Bolin.

Preparation of Real Estate Purchase Agreement in order to sell estate’s real
estate to heir, Sheryl L. Stapinski.

Preparation of required affidavits to establish clear title to real estate.

File Petition to Sell Real Estate under rules of supervised administration.
Close on sale of real estate.

File Inventory of estate with court as result of supervised administration.
Establish requirements of bonding of personal representative with counsel for
David Bolin.

Work with mortgage company of heir, Sheryl L. Stapinski, to facilitate real

estate closing.



1. Establish full accounting as result of supervised administration.

m. Assist in reporting of stolen property of estate.

n. Manage unfounded objections to final account made by David Bolin.

0. Respond to discovery requests pertaining to matters outside probate estate
required by David Bolin.

4. That said Personal Representative is now in the process of winding up the affairs
of the estate in order to make final distribution and to close said estate, and in connection
therewith, it is necessary that the fees of said Personal Representative and her attorney be
determined and allowed by the Court.

6. That the total value of the estate for the purposes of the inventory of the estate is
approximately One Hundred Seven Thousand Four Hundred Fifty Nine and 17/100th Dollars
($107,459.17), and the value of the estate for Indiana inheritance tax purposes is approximately
Two Hundred Six Thousand Two Hundred Nine and 69/100th Dollars ($206.209.69).

x That neither the Personal Representative nor her attorney have received any
payment for the services rendered on behalf of the estate, and they believe that just and
reasonable compensation to the Personal Representative for her services is the sum of Four
Thousand Six Hundred Dollars ($4.600.00) in that she has over two hundred (200) hours of
services rendered in attending to her duties as personal representative; and for the services of
said attorney the sum of Sixteen Thousand Eight Hundred Eighty Eight and 64/100th Dollars
($16,888.64) is reasonable, in that the attorney’s office has over eighty (80) hours devoted to the
legal, tax, distribution, accounting, and auditing aspects of this estate. In addition to hours of
time devoted to this estate, the Personal Representative's attorney has incurred and paid legal

expenses in the amount of Two Hundred Thirty Two and 14/100th Dollars ($232.14) for
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administrative costs such as filing and publication fees. That a full detail of the attorney’s time
and expenses is attached hereto and made a part hereof as Exhibit “A.” That said sums due the
Personal Representative and her attorney are not in full and final settlement for their services
provided to this estate, as objections have been filed to the final account on this estate, and
additional pleadings and attendance at hearings are expected in order to close this estate.

WHEREFORE, said Personal Representative and said attorney pray that the Court fix
and determine their fees for their services rendered in connection with this estate through the
date of this petition and order the same to be paid as costs of administration of this estate.

WHEREFORE, said Personal Representative and said attorney pray that the Court allow
additional fees for their services to be rendered in connection with this estate pertaining to any
work required in order to close this estate, from the date of this petition forward, and for all other
relief which is proper in the premises.

Respectfully Submitted,

Marjorie I\UZemkewmé)'-’ersona Reprcse@we
of estate of Robert P. Bolin, deceased

J. Brian Hittinger (#16428-64)

Krieg DeVault LLP

833 W. Lincoln Highway, Suite 410W

Schererville, IN 46375 (219) 227-6100

Direct No. (219) 227-6114

Attorney for Personal Representative,
Marjorie M. Zemkewicz
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Telephone: 317-636-4341
Telecopier: 317-636-1507
Fed, EIN # 35-1055087

KRIEG DEVAULT LLP

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
ONE INDIANA SQUARE, SUITE 2800
INDIANAPOLIS, INDIANA 46204-2079

July 28,2010
Invoice Number 274843

Our File# ZEMK 00001

Marjorie Zemkewicz

10301 Fox Run
Munster, IN 46321

Estate of Robert P. Bolin

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH 07/30/2010

04/07/08 JBH

04/09/08 JBH

05/21/08 JBH

06/16/08 JBH

06/17/08 JBH

Preparation for and office conference with Sheryl Stapinski and Marjorie
Zemkewicz regarding the probate process associated with their father's estate.
Review of probate and non-probate assets within estate. Discussion of
creditors and creditor’s claims. Discussion of supervised and unsupervised
administration. Discussion of possible disclaimer to be executed by Marjorie
Zemkewicz due to large transfer of assets outside of probate estate.

2.50 hrs 245 /hr
Outline of expected probate assets. Preliminary preparation of court
pleadings. Preparation of draft of proposed fee engagement letter.

1.00 hrs 245 /hr
Draft Proof of Will by Subscribing Witness and correspondence to Larry G.
Lancaster; finalized affidavit and correspondence which was transmitted to
Mr. Lancaster for review, signature and return.

0.50 hrs 245 jhr
Preparation of correspondence to court. Preparation of correspondence 1o
personal representative. Preparation of necessary petitions to open estate.
Finalize same.

2.00 hrs 245 /hr
Preparation of Petition for Probate and Issuance of Letters Testamentary for
Unsupervised Administration, Notice of Unsupervised Administration, Oath
of Personal Representative and Instructions to Personal Representative of
Unsupervised Estate; correspondence to Marjorie M. Zemkewicz transmitting
same along with Consent for Appointment of Personal Representative and
Unsupervised Administration of Decedent's Estate; correspondence to David
Bolin, Donna Cox and Sheryl Stapinski transmitting Consent for signature and
return.

T S' 1.00 hrs 245 /hr
PFENDANT'S |
o EXHIBIT
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ZEMK. 00001

07/15/08

07/18/08

08/25/08

09/12/08

12/17/08

12/30/08

01/12/09

04/06/09

04/15/09

04/15/09

04/20/09

04/27/09

05/01/09

JBH

JBH

JBH

JBH

JBH

JBH

JBH

LMT

LMT

IBH

JBH

IBH

LMT

Invoice # 274843

Compilation of required documentation for transmittal to Probate Clerk, Lake
Circuit Court to open estate.

0.50 hrs 245 /hr
Obtain Tax EIN from Internal Revenue Service.
0.30 hrs 245 /fhr

Receipt of Proof of Publication from Pilcher Publishing; prepare CCS filing
Proof of Publication with Probate Court; correspondence to Marjorie
Zemkewicz regarding current status of estate.

0.50 hrs 245 /hr
Preparation of email correspondence to personal representative.
1.00 hrs 245 /hr

Preparation of Petition to Waive Requirement of Filing Indiana Inheritance
Tax Return and Determining no Tax Due and form Order Waiving the
Requirement of Filing Indiana Inheritance Tax Return and Determining no
Tax Due with subsequent correspondence to Margaret Zemkewicz
transmitting same for review, signature and return.

0.80 hrs 245 /hr
Preparation of cover letter and CCS entry form transmitting Petition to Waive
Filing of Indiana Inheritance Tax Return and for a Determination of No Tax
Due and Order for filing with probate division of Lake Circuit Court.

0.30 hrs 245 /hr
Receipt of file stamped Petition and Motion. Correspondence to Marjorie M.
Zemkewicz transmitting filed Petition and Order to Waive Filing of Indiana
Inheritance Tax Return and for a Determination of no Tax Due.

0.30 hrs 270 /hr
Telephone conference with Marge Zemkewicz, personal representative,
regarding situation that has arisen in regard to her brother purchasing
decedent's residence in Cedar Lake; preparation of memorandum.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Drafted correspondence to David Bolin regarding his interest in purchasing
decedent's residence. Email to Marjorie Zemkiewicz requesting she review
letter to David Bolin and provide comments.

0.40 hrs 125 /br
Preparation of correspondence regarding real estate of heir of estate.
0.25 hrs 270 fhr

Lengthy telephone conference with David Bolin. Telephone conference with
personal representative discussing possible sale of real estate. Follow-up
telephone conference with David Bolin.

1.50 hrs 270 /hr
Preparation of correspondence to David Bolin regarding final offer to
purchase decedent's personal residence. Copy to personal representative.

' 1.00 hrs 270 /hr

Telephone call to James Nagy, attorney for David Bolin.

0.10 hrs 125 /hr
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ZEMK 00001

05/04/09

05/21/09

05/22/09

05/28/09

06/03/09

06/11/09

06/12/09

06/12/09

06/18/09

06/19/09

06/29/09

07/02/09

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

JBH

LMT

JBH

LMT

LMT

Invoice # 274843

Draft Agreement to Purchase Real Estate in regard to David Bolin purchasing
decedent's residence at 14515 Lake Shore Drive, Cedar Lake.

2.00 hrs 125 /hr
Voice mail message left for James Nagy, attorney for David Bolin, in
response to his voice mail regarding proposed Purchase Agreement.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Returned telephone call to Margaret Zemkewicz. Telephone conference with
Ms. Zemkewicz advising current status of sale of decedent's residence to
brother, David Bolin. Subsequent receipt of correspondence from Mr. Nagy
outlining his client, David Bolin's, position in regard to purchasing decedent's
residence. Drafted correspondence to Mr. Nagy transmitting proposed
Agreement to Purchase.

0.60 hrs 125 /hr
Receipt of voice mail from attorney James Nagy to transmit proposed
purchase agreement.

0.10 hrs 125 /hr
Telephone conference with James Nagy, attorney for David Bolin, regarding
Agreement to Purchase Real Estate and his client's position regarding down
payment.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
Respond to e-mail from personal representative, Margaret Zemkewicz,
regarding brother's proposed purchase of residence.

0.10 hrs 125 /hr
Office conference with attorney Brian Hittinger after receipt of e-mail from
David Bolin with subsequent telephonic conference with Marge Zemkewicz,
personal representative regarding same.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr
Review of e-mail correspondence from David Bolin. Office conference with
Laura Trznadel to respond to correspondence. Telephone conference with
personal representative. Telephone conference with attorney James Nagy.
Preparation of detailed e-mail correspondence to personal representative.
Preparation of notes to file.

2.00 hrs 270 /hr
Make revisions to Agreement to Purchase Real Estate and draft proposed
Stipulated Agreement pursuant to discussion between attorney Brian Hittinger
and attorney James Nagy.

2.00 hrs 125 /hr
Preparation of stipulated agreement and corresponding revisions to proposed
real estate purchase agreement. Forward to opposing counsel.

2.00 hrs 270 /hr
Drafted correspondence to attorney James Nagy following up letter of June
19th transmitting revised sales agreement. ;

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
E-mail correspondence to personal representative advising David Bolin is no
longer interested in purchasing decedent'’s residence.

0.10 hrs 125 /hr

Page 3
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ZEMEK 00001 Invoice # 274843 Pa,ge 4

07/08/09 LMT Correspondence to attorney James Nagy confirming he no longer represents
David Bolin.
0.30 hrs 125 /hr 37.50
07/16/09 LMT Telephone conference with personal representative. Memorandum to attorney

Brian Hittinger and file regarding conversation, all in regard to David Bolin's
decision to once again attempt to purchase decedent's residence.
0.30 hrs 125 /hr 3750
07/16/09 JBH Telephone conference with attorney Shaun T. Olsen regarding David Bolin's
request to purchase the real estate using new Jegal counsel. Receipt of e-mail
correspondence from personal representative. Discussion of David Bolin's
election to manage estate as supervised.
0.75 hrs 270 /hr
07/21/09 LMT Email from Marge Zemkiewicz; transmittal via e-mail to Marge Zemkiewicz
copy of letter and Petition to Convert to Supervised Estate filed by Shaun
Olsen on behalf of his client, David Bolin.
0.30 hrs 125 /hr
07/22/09 LMT Receipt of e-mail correspondence from Marge Zemkiewicz. Respond to
e-mail. Lengthy telephone conference with Mrs. Zemkiewicz. Draft proposed
Executrix's Inventory with subsequent transmittal via of same e-mail to Mrs.
Zemkiewicz. Begin draft of proposed Executrix's Status Report which 1s due
on or before July 30, 2009.
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2.00 hrs 125 /hr 250.03
07/27/09 LMT Telephone conference with personal representative regarding preparation of
Inventory.
0.20 hrs 125 /hr 25.00
07/28/09 LMT Receipt of inventory from Marge Zemkewicz. Work on revisions to inventory.
Receipt of Order from Court setting bond hearing for September 22, 2009.
0.50 hrs 125 /hr 62.50
07/31/09 LMT Finalize Status Report. Cover letter to Probate Clerk transmitting Status
Report and CCS Entry Form via certified mail with copy to attorney Shaun

Olsen.
0.80 hrs 125 /hr 100.01
08/03/09 LMT Correspondence to personal representative, Marge Zemkewicz, transmitting
copy of Order regarding hearing on bond request set for September 22, 2009.
0.20 hrs 125 /hr 25.00
08/06/09 LMT Received, reviewed and responded to personal representatives questions
regarding bond hearing.
0.40 hrs 125 /hr 50.01

08/07/09 LMT Draft Petition to Sell Real Estate; work on Inventory. E-mail correspondence
transmitting revised Inventory to Marge Zemkewicz for review and comment.
0.30 hrs 125 /hr
08/13/09 LMT Draft Petition for No Bond, revise Petition for Authority to Sell, revise
Agreement to Purchase. E-mail correspondence to Marge Zemkewicz
requesting copy of appraisal and various other matters.
1.00 hrs 125 /hr 1
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ZEMK 00001

08/14/09

08/17/09

08/18/09

08/18/09

08/31/09

09/15/09

09/21/09

09/22/09

09/25/09

09/29/09

10/05/09

LMT

LMT

LMT

JBH

LMT

LMT

JBH

JBH

LMT

JBH

LMT

Invoice # 274843

Draft correspondence to Sheryl Stapinski regarding Agreement to Purchase
decedent's residence.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
Re-draft Stipulated Agreement in light of Sheryl Stapinski's purchase of
decedent's residence. E-mail to Marge Zemkewicz regarding Sheryl Stapinski
making earnest money deposit.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr
Receipt of response to e-mail from Marge Zemkewicz regarding Shery]
Stapinski making earnest money deposit. Revise Sales Purchase Agreement in
light of earnest money deposit. Revise draft correspondence to Sheryl
Stapinski.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr
Preparation of draft agreement to purchase real estate and corresponding
correspondence.

1.00 hrs 270 /hr
E-mail correspondence to personal representative regarding status of obtaining
signature on new purchase agreement.

0.10 hrs 125 /hr
Telephone conversation with Sue from attorney Thomas Kirsch's office
regarding his representation of Sheryl Stapinski as purchaser of decedent's
residerice. Respond to e-mail from Sheryl Stapinski. E-mail to personal
representative regarding scheduling appointment to meet prior to September
22nd hearing.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr
Review of pleadings for bond hearing scheduled for Tuesday, September 22,
2009. Preparation of pleadings to sell real estate pursuant to written contract.
Preparation of Executrix's Inventory. Preparation of CCS forms. Telephone
conference with attorney Shaun T. Olsen. Several telephone conierences in
follow-up with Mr. Olsen.

2.00 hrs 270 /hr
Telephone conference with attorney Shaun Olsen. Telephone conference with
personal representative. Office conference with personal representative.
Preparation of several revisions to draft petitions in light of no contest being
filed by David Bolin. Preparation for, travel to and appearance before
Magistrate to obtain court order requiring no bond. File Inventory and
Petition to Sell Real Estate.

2.75 hrs 270 /hr
Correspondence to Marge Zemkewicz, personal representative, transmitting
file stamped copies of Petition for No Bond, Notice of No Contest to No
Bond, Petition for Authority to Sale Real Estate and advising of October 6th
hearing.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Telephone conference with attorney Shaun Olsen regarding distribution of
personal property.

0.50 hrs 270 /hr
Prepare draft Executrix's Deed for transfer of decedent's real estate.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr

Page 35
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10/06/09

10/08/09

10/14/09

10/19/09

10/20/09

10/21/09

10/23/09

10/27/09

10/28/09

10/30/09

IBH

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

Invoice # 274843

Preparation for, travel to and attendance at hearing before Probate
Commissioner on petition to sell real estate. Matter was contested. Evidence
was submitted. Proposed Order was modified prior to entry. Order entered.
Deed approved and submitted.

4.00 hrs 270 /hr
Telephone conference with Diane Zimmerman of MBC Mortgage, broker for
Sheryl Stapinski. Ordered title commitment from Ticor Title Insurance
Company.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr
Telephone conversation with Sue from attorney Tom Kirsch's office, who
represents buyer, Sheryl Stapinski, advising the order had been granted
authorizing sale of decedent's residence and title report ordered and that we
would provide Mr. Kirsch with a copy of both documents.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Telephone conversation with Sharon at Ticor Title to determine why title
report has not yet been received. Telephone conversation with Nikki at MBC
Mortgage advising her Ticor Title has put a rush on the title report.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
Receipt and review of Title Commitment from Ticor Title. Transmittal of
same to Nikki at MBC Mortgage Corporation, lender for buyer. E-mail
correspondence to Marge Zemkewicz transmitting copy of Title Commitment.
Transmittal via facsimile of Title Commitment to Thomas Kirsch, attorney for
Sheryl Stapinski.

1.00 hrs 125 /hr
Receive and respond to e-mail from Marge Zemkewicz regarding real estate
tax for 2008 payable 2009 on decedent's residence.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Receipt of e-mail with accompanying receipt reflecting payment of 2008 real
estate taxes on decedent's residence. E-mail correspondence transmitting copy
of receipt of Ticor Title in reference to Item F.2. of title commitment.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Receipt and respond to e-mail from Sheryl Stapinski regarding possible
closing Friday, October 30. Prepare draft of Indiana Sales Disclosure Form
regarding sale of Cedar Lake property.

0.40 hrs 125 /hr
E-mails from Marge Zemkewicz and respond thereto regarding closing.
Multiple telephone conversations with Clerk of Probate Court, Crown Point,
Indiana regard Deed, Order and current date Letters Testamentary.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
Telephone call and facsimile from Diane Zimmerman of MBC Mortgage
advising purchase can close.Telephone call to Ticor Title leaving voice mail
that parties want to close November 3, 2009. E-mails to Sheryl Stapinski and
Marge Zemkewicz regarding possible closing on November 2, 2009 and
requesting Ms. Stapinski to have her attorney, Tom Kirsch, contact Ticor to
set up closing as attomey Brian Hittinger will not be aftending.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr

Page 6
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11/03/09

11/04/09

11/05/09

11/10/09

11/10/09

11/11/09

12/01/09

12/03/09

01/25/10

03/01/10

03/01/10

LMT

LMT

LMT

LMT

IBH

LMT

JBH

LMT

LMT

JBH

JBH
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Receipt of e-mail from personal representative advising closing on decedent's
real estate is scheduled for November 4, 2009; compilation of documentation
required for personal representative at closing; correspondence to personal
representative outlining documents which will be picked up by personal
representative November 3, 2009.

0.50 hrs 125 /br
Receipt and review of settlement statement from closing agent regarding sale
of decedent's residence. Subsequent telephone conversations with personal
representative.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Receipt of e-mail from personal representative regarding inability to deposit
check from proceeds of sale of decedent's residence. Responded to same.

0.20 hrs 125 /hr
Preparation of draft final accounting and for authority to distribute as well as
final accounting for review by attorney Brian Hittinger.

1.00 hrs 125 /br
Review of petition to settle estate. Review of accounting pertaining to estate.
Preparation of revisions thereto.

1.00 hrs 270 /br
Preparation of list of furniture, personal belongings of decedent to transmit via
e-mail to personal representative for review and return all in connection with
petition to settle.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
Review of correspondence from attorney Olsen and corresponding
interrogatories. Preliminary research and review of the probate statute on
requirements of affective discovery.

1.25 hrs 270 /hr
In response to telephone conversation with Shannon at Ticor Title, there was a
slight error made on the legal description on the deed and affidavit.
Correspondence to Ticor Title authorizing making correction to documents
and requesting we be provided with a copy once the correction is made.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr
Respond to e-mail from personal representative. Review, mark-up and revise
Final Account and Petition to Settle and Allow Account and for Authority to
Distribute Estate for review by attorney Brian Hittinger.

1.75 hrs 125 /hr
Finalize petition of personal representative required to close estate.
Preparation of several e-mail correspondence. Review pleadings. Mark-up
and finalize final accounting.

5.00 hrs 285 /hr
Review and finalize Petition to Settle and Allow Account and for Authority to
Distribute Estate. Reserve time and expenses to Final Petition and Final
Orders required to close estate. '

3.10 hrs 285 /hr

Page 7
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ZEMK 00001 Invoice # 274843 Page 8

03/05/10 LMT Finalize petition to settle and for authority for transmittal to personal
representative for final review, signature and return; correspondence
transmitting petition to personal representative.
1.75 hrs 125 /hr 218.78
03/08/10 LMT Final review and revisions made to petition to settle and authority to
distribute; correspondence to Marge Zemkewicz transmitting petition for
review, signature and return; e-mail to Marge Zemkewicz advising letter and
petition being mailed out.
1.00 hrs 125 /hr 125.01
04/09/10 LMT Receipt of e-mail correspondence from personal representative, Marge
Zemkewicz. Made revisions to Final Account and Petition to Settle and
Allow Account in light of e-mail from Marge Zemkewicz. Multiple e-mails
with Marge Zemkewicz. E-mail correspondence transmitting draft of Final
Account for review to Marge Zemkewicz.
1.25 hrs 125 /hr 156.27
04/13/10 LMT Finalize Final Account and Petition to Close. Compile petition with exhibits.
Correspondence to personal representative transmitting petition for review,
signature and return.

0.50 hrs 125 /hr 62.50
04/26/10 LMT Prepare CCS for filing Final Account. Prepare correspondence transmitting
Final Account to Probate Division, Lake Circuit Court for filing.
0.50 hrs 125 My 62.50

05/10/10 LMT Correspondence to personal representative advising of May 25, 2010 hearing.
Facsimile to Shaun Olsen transmitting copy of CCS reflecting May 25, 2010
hearing. Mail copy of CCS to Mr. Olsen.

0.30 hrs 125 /hr 37.50
05/13/10 JBH Telephone conference with attorney Shaun Olsen. Review of accounting
submitted to court. Set-up date for further conference call.
0.75 hrs 285 /hr 21337
05/17/10 JBH Telephone conference with attorney Shaun Olsen. Review accounting in

detail prior to conversation. Review file during telephone conference.
Discussed continued hearing. Telephone conference with office of personal
representative. Establish issues objected to by heir.

1.25 hrs 285 /hr 356.27
05/18/10 JBH Preparation of e-mail correspondence to personal representative.

0.25 hrs 285 /hr 71.26
05/21/10 LMT Telephone conversation with Probate Commissioner George Parras.

Preparation of Agreed Motion to Continue. Preparation of form Order.
Preparation of CCS Entry Form. Transmittal of CCS Entry Form via
facsimile to Probate Commissioner per his request. Correspondence
transmitting aforementioned documents to Probate Division, Lake Circuit
Court for filing.

3

1.50 hrs 125 /hr 187.52



ZEMK 00001 Invoice # 274843 Page 9
06/07/10 LMT Transmittal via facsimile of copy of Order and CCS reflecting hearing
rescheduled for July 13, 2010 on Final Account and Petition to Settle.
Correspondence to personal representative, Margaret Zemkewicz, transmitting
copy of Order setting July 13, 2010 hearing. Review receipts from personal
representative. Begin drafting revised petition.
1.75 hrs 125 /hr 218.78
06/08/10 LMT Continue work on revised petition.
0.75 hrs 125 /hr 93.76
06/18/10 LMT Work on finalizing compilation of receipts for transmittal to David Bolin's
attorney in connection with final accounting of personal representative.
1.00 hrs 125 /hr 125.01
06/21/10 LMT Preparation of revised petition for transmittal to personal representative for
review and signature.
1.00 hrs 125 /hr 125.01
06/23/10 LMT Finalize revised petition for authority. Prepare, file and serve petition and
CCS entry form.
0.50 hrs 125 /hr 62.50
07/12/10 JBH Receipt of objection filed to finalize account. Review of same. Review of
estate receipts filed with accounting. Telephone conference with personal
representative. Telephone conference with Office of Attorney Shaun Olsen.
Receipt of continuance of hearing. Reset court hearing date. Review order on
discovery. Preparation of several e-mails with heirs of estate.
2.25 hrs 285 /hr 641.30
07/13/10 SPL Attention to issue involving interrogatories served on personal representative
and order from the court regarding the same.
0.20 hrs 240 /hr 48.00
07/13/10 JBH Receipt of several e-mail correspondences. Preparation of e-mail
correspondence to the personal representative. Telephone conference with the
Office of Attorney Shaun Olsen. Research Trial Rule 33 and Trial Rule 34.
1.00 hrs 285 /hr 285.03
07/14/10 SPL Review Court Order to compel discovery responses and analyze whether
Indiana Rules of Trial Procedure regarding interrogatories and their scope.
0.30 hrs 240 /hr 72.01
07/25/10 SPL Work on Motion to Reconsider Order Compelling Discovery.
1.80 hrs 240 /hr 432.04
07/26/10 SPL Analyze litigation strategy with Brian Hittinger.
0.10 hrs 240 /hr 24.00
Total fees for this matter $16,888.64
DISBURSEMENTS
07/14/08 Filing Fees - Clerk, Lake Circuit Court 156.00
07/14/08 Pilcher Publishing Company 42.00
10/28/09 J. Brian Hittinger; Travel to/from hearing before Lake Superior Court on 9.90



ZEMK 00001 Invoice # 274843 Page 10

posting of bond and sale of real estate.

07/30/10 Postage 22.64
07/30/10 Photocopy 1.60
Total disbursements for this matter $232.14

TOTAL FEES 16,888.64

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 232.14

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $17,120.78

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE $17,120.78

PLEASE PAY THIS AMOUNT $17,120.78

This invoice is due upon receipt. Please make checks payable to Krieg
DeVault LLP and reference the invoice number.


David Bolin
Highlight


STATE OF INDIANA ) LAKE CIRCUIT COURT

) 88: PROBATE DIVISION
COUNTY OF LAKE ) CROWN POINT, INDIANA
ADMINISTRATION OF ESTATE OF )
ROBERT P. BOLIN, ) ESTATE NO. 45C01-0807-EU-188
DECEASED. )

ORDER ALLOWING FEES OF PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE AND ATTORNEY

Comes now Marjorie M. Zemkewicz, as Personal Representative of the estate of
Robert P. Bolin, deceased, and submits her Verified Petition for Compensation and Attorney
Fees, which petition is on file with the Court and a part of the Court’s record.

And the Court, having examined said petition and being duly advised, now finds that the
facts stated therein are true, and that the Court should fix and allow their fees for services
performed in the administration of said estate incurred to date. That additional fees may be due
and payable to the Personal Representative and attorney as additional time may be required to
close said estate.

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED, ADJUDGED, AND DECREED by the Court that there
be, and hereby is, allowed to Marjorie M. Zemkewicz, Personal Representative, for her services
as personal representative of the estate of Robert P. Bolin, deceased, the sum of Four Thousand
Six Hundred Dollars ($4,600.00), and that J. Brian Hittinger of Krieg DeVault LLP, is allowed
fees for the attorney for the Personal Representative the sum of Sixteen Thousand Eight Hundred
Eighty Eight and 64/100" Dollars ($16,888.64) and Two Hundred Thirty Two and 14/100"
Dollars ($232.14) for costs incurred by the attorney in rendering legal services in this estate, and

that said Personal Representative hereby is authorized to pay said amounts in allowance for



services rendered to date, said amounts to be paid as part of the expenses of administration of

said estate,

ALL OF WHICH IS FOUND AND RECOMMENDED this day of
, 2010,

Probate Commissioner, Lake Circuit Court

ALL OF WHICH IS SO ORDERED AND APPROVED this day of
, 2010,

Judge, Lake Circuit Court
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